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STATE OF GEORGIA  
COUNTY OF CHEROKEE 

RESOLUTION NO. 2012 – R -  001  
 

WHEREAS, the Board of Elections and Registration of Cherokee County has requested 
that the Cherokee County Board of Commissioners set qualifying fees for various County 
offices within Cherokee County for the 2012 General Election pursuant to O.C.G.A. § 21-2-
131(a); and 
 

WHEREAS, the Board of Commissioners desires to comply with said request from the 
Board of Elections and Registration. 
 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Cherokee County Board of 
Commissioners and it is hereby enacted pursuant to the authority of the same that the 
following qualifying fees for the General Election to be held on Tuesday, November 6, 2012 
are hereby set, and shall be published prior to February 1, 2012 as required by law, as 
follows: 

 
1.  Board of Commissioners Member Post 2  $900.00 

 
2.  Board of Commissioners Member Post 3  $900.00 
 
3.  School Board Members     $216.00 
 
4.  Clerk of the Superior Court    $2,533.76 
 
5.  Judge of the Probate Court     $2,533.76 
 
6.  Cherokee County Sheriff     $2,597.16 
 
7.  Cherokee County Tax Commissioner   $2,533.76 
 
8.  Judge of the State Court     $3,921.81 
 
9.  Chief Judge of the Magistrate Court   $2,533.76 

  
10.   Chief Judge of the State Court    $3,921.81 
 
11.   Cherokee County Coroner     $35.00 
 
12.   Cherokee County Surveyor    $35.00 

  

ADOPTED this 17th day of January, 2012. 

              
L.B. Ahrens, Chairman 
Cherokee County Board of Commissioners 

Attest: 
      
Christy Black, County Clerk 













$11,410,000 
Cherokee County (Georgia) 

General Obligation Park and Green Space Bond, Series 2012 

Summary of Bids 
 

 

Ranking of Bidders                 Interest Rate       

1.   Bank of America Public Capital Corp 
1.90% - Callable at 101.5% on before 2/28/2019 and 

par thereafter. 

Legal Fees: $7,000 

2. Capital One Public Funding 

2.55% - Non-Callable 

2.59% - Callable at par on 2/1/2022 

Legal Fees: $0 

3. JP Morgan Chase Bank 

2.57% - Non-Callable 

2.64% - Callable at par on 4/1/2022 

2.74% - Callable at par on 4/1/2017 

Legal Fees: $8,000 

4. SunTrust Bank 
2.63% - Callable at par on 2/1/2019. Bid did include 

2-way yield maintenance language 

Legal Fees: $7,500 

5. Regions Bank 
3.27%- Callable at par on 1/1/2023 

Legal Fees: $0 

6.  Ameris Bank No Bid 

7.  Bank of Canton  No Bid 

8.   Bank of North Georgia No Bid 

9. Branch Banking & Trust (BB&T) No Bid 

10.  Cherokee Bank  No Bid 

11.  First Cherokee State Bank  No Bid 

12.  Renasant  Bank  No Bid 

13.  United Community Bank No Bid 

14.  Wells Fargo Bank No Bid 
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SOURCES AND USES OF FUNDS

Cherokee County (GA)
General Obligation Park and Green Space Bonds, Series 2012

Final Numbers

Dated Date 01/26/2012
Delivery Date 01/26/2012

Sources:

Bond Proceeds:
Par Amount 11,410,000.00

11,410,000.00

Uses:

Project Fund Deposits:
Project Fund 11,295,655.00

Delivery Date Expenses:
Cost of Issuance 114,345.00

11,410,000.00
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BOND SUMMARY STATISTICS

Cherokee County (GA)
General Obligation Park and Green Space Bonds, Series 2012

Final Numbers

Dated Date 01/26/2012
Delivery Date 01/26/2012
Last Maturity 04/01/2026

Arbitrage Yield 1.900196%
True Interest Cost (TIC) 1.900196%
Net Interest Cost (NIC) 1.900000%
All-In TIC 2.092094%
Average Coupon 1.900000%

Average Life (years) 5.800
Duration of Issue (years) 5.321

Par Amount 11,410,000.00
Bond Proceeds 11,410,000.00
Total Interest 1,257,422.64
Net Interest 1,257,422.64
Total Debt Service 12,667,422.64
Maximum Annual Debt Service 1,840,525.00
Average Annual Debt Service 893,295.23

Underwriter's Fees (per $1000)
  Average Takedown
  Other Fee

Total Underwriter's Discount

Bid Price 100.000000

Par Average Average PV of 1 bp
Bond Component Value Price Coupon Life change

Term Bond Due 4/1/2026 11,410,000.00 100.000 1.900% 5.800 5,956.05

11,410,000.00 5.800 5,956.05

All-In Arbitrage
TIC TIC Yield

Par Value 11,410,000.00 11,410,000.00 11,410,000.00
  + Accrued Interest
  + Premium (Discount)
  - Underwriter's Discount
  - Cost of Issuance Expense -114,345.00
  - Other Amounts

Target Value 11,410,000.00 11,295,655.00 11,410,000.00

Target Date 01/26/2012 01/26/2012 01/26/2012
Yield 1.900196% 2.092094% 1.900196%
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BOND PRICING

Cherokee County (GA)
General Obligation Park and Green Space Bonds, Series 2012

Final Numbers

Maturity
Bond Component Date Amount Rate Yield Price

Term Bond Due 4/1/2026:
04/01/2012 1,600,000 1.900% 1.900% 100.000
04/01/2013 1,670,000 1.900% 1.900% 100.000
04/01/2014 920,000 1.900% 1.900% 100.000
04/01/2015 840,000 1.900% 1.900% 100.000
04/01/2016 770,000 1.900% 1.900% 100.000
04/01/2017 700,000 1.900% 1.900% 100.000
04/01/2018 630,000 1.900% 1.900% 100.000
04/01/2019 565,000 1.900% 1.900% 100.000
04/01/2020 495,000 1.900% 1.900% 100.000
04/01/2021 435,000 1.900% 1.900% 100.000
04/01/2022 365,000 1.900% 1.900% 100.000
04/01/2023 300,000 1.900% 1.900% 100.000
04/01/2024 275,000 1.900% 1.900% 100.000
04/01/2025 180,000 1.900% 1.900% 100.000
04/01/2026 1,665,000 1.900% 1.900% 100.000

11,410,000

Dated Date 01/26/2012
Delivery Date 01/26/2012
First Coupon 04/01/2012

Par Amount 11,410,000.00
Original Issue Discount

Production 11,410,000.00 100.000000%
Underwriter's Discount

Purchase Price 11,410,000.00 100.000000%
Accrued Interest

Net Proceeds 11,410,000.00
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BOND DEBT SERVICE

Cherokee County (GA)
General Obligation Park and Green Space Bonds, Series 2012

Final Numbers

Period Bond Total
Ending Principal Coupon Interest Debt Service Balance Bond Value

12/31/2012 1,600,000 1.900% 132,337.64 1,732,337.64 9,810,000 9,810,000
12/31/2013 1,670,000 1.900% 170,525.00 1,840,525.00 8,140,000 8,140,000
12/31/2014 920,000 1.900% 145,920.00 1,065,920.00 7,220,000 7,220,000
12/31/2015 840,000 1.900% 129,200.00 969,200.00 6,380,000 6,380,000
12/31/2016 770,000 1.900% 113,905.00 883,905.00 5,610,000 5,610,000
12/31/2017 700,000 1.900% 99,940.00 799,940.00 4,910,000 4,910,000
12/31/2018 630,000 1.900% 87,305.00 717,305.00 4,280,000 4,280,000
12/31/2019 565,000 1.900% 75,952.50 640,952.50 3,715,000 3,715,000
12/31/2020 495,000 1.900% 65,882.50 560,882.50 3,220,000 3,220,000
12/31/2021 435,000 1.900% 57,047.50 492,047.50 2,785,000 2,785,000
12/31/2022 365,000 1.900% 49,447.50 414,447.50 2,420,000 2,420,000
12/31/2023 300,000 1.900% 43,130.00 343,130.00 2,120,000 2,120,000
12/31/2024 275,000 1.900% 37,667.50 312,667.50 1,845,000 1,845,000
12/31/2025 180,000 1.900% 33,345.00 213,345.00 1,665,000 1,665,000
12/31/2026 1,665,000 1.900% 15,817.50 1,680,817.50

11,410,000 1,257,422.64 12,667,422.64
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BOND DEBT SERVICE

Cherokee County (GA)
General Obligation Park and Green Space Bonds, Series 2012

Final Numbers

Period Annual Bond Total
Ending Principal Coupon Interest Debt Service Debt Service Balance Bond Value

01/26/2012 11,410,000 11,410,000
04/01/2012 1,600,000 1.900% 39,142.64 1,639,142.64 9,810,000 9,810,000
10/01/2012 93,195.00 93,195.00 9,810,000 9,810,000
12/31/2012 1,732,337.64 9,810,000 9,810,000
04/01/2013 1,670,000 1.900% 93,195.00 1,763,195.00 8,140,000 8,140,000
10/01/2013 77,330.00 77,330.00 8,140,000 8,140,000
12/31/2013 1,840,525.00 8,140,000 8,140,000
04/01/2014 920,000 1.900% 77,330.00 997,330.00 7,220,000 7,220,000
10/01/2014 68,590.00 68,590.00 7,220,000 7,220,000
12/31/2014 1,065,920.00 7,220,000 7,220,000
04/01/2015 840,000 1.900% 68,590.00 908,590.00 6,380,000 6,380,000
10/01/2015 60,610.00 60,610.00 6,380,000 6,380,000
12/31/2015 969,200.00 6,380,000 6,380,000
04/01/2016 770,000 1.900% 60,610.00 830,610.00 5,610,000 5,610,000
10/01/2016 53,295.00 53,295.00 5,610,000 5,610,000
12/31/2016 883,905.00 5,610,000 5,610,000
04/01/2017 700,000 1.900% 53,295.00 753,295.00 4,910,000 4,910,000
10/01/2017 46,645.00 46,645.00 4,910,000 4,910,000
12/31/2017 799,940.00 4,910,000 4,910,000
04/01/2018 630,000 1.900% 46,645.00 676,645.00 4,280,000 4,280,000
10/01/2018 40,660.00 40,660.00 4,280,000 4,280,000
12/31/2018 717,305.00 4,280,000 4,280,000
04/01/2019 565,000 1.900% 40,660.00 605,660.00 3,715,000 3,715,000
10/01/2019 35,292.50 35,292.50 3,715,000 3,715,000
12/31/2019 640,952.50 3,715,000 3,715,000
04/01/2020 495,000 1.900% 35,292.50 530,292.50 3,220,000 3,220,000
10/01/2020 30,590.00 30,590.00 3,220,000 3,220,000
12/31/2020 560,882.50 3,220,000 3,220,000
04/01/2021 435,000 1.900% 30,590.00 465,590.00 2,785,000 2,785,000
10/01/2021 26,457.50 26,457.50 2,785,000 2,785,000
12/31/2021 492,047.50 2,785,000 2,785,000
04/01/2022 365,000 1.900% 26,457.50 391,457.50 2,420,000 2,420,000
10/01/2022 22,990.00 22,990.00 2,420,000 2,420,000
12/31/2022 414,447.50 2,420,000 2,420,000
04/01/2023 300,000 1.900% 22,990.00 322,990.00 2,120,000 2,120,000
10/01/2023 20,140.00 20,140.00 2,120,000 2,120,000
12/31/2023 343,130.00 2,120,000 2,120,000
04/01/2024 275,000 1.900% 20,140.00 295,140.00 1,845,000 1,845,000
10/01/2024 17,527.50 17,527.50 1,845,000 1,845,000
12/31/2024 312,667.50 1,845,000 1,845,000
04/01/2025 180,000 1.900% 17,527.50 197,527.50 1,665,000 1,665,000
10/01/2025 15,817.50 15,817.50 1,665,000 1,665,000
12/31/2025 213,345.00 1,665,000 1,665,000
04/01/2026 1,665,000 1.900% 15,817.50 1,680,817.50
12/31/2026 1,680,817.50

11,410,000 1,257,422.64 12,667,422.64 12,667,422.64
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FORM 8038 STATISTICS

Cherokee County (GA)
General Obligation Park and Green Space Bonds, Series 2012

Final Numbers

Dated Date 01/26/2012
Delivery Date 01/26/2012

Redemption
Bond Component Date Principal Coupon Price Issue Price at Maturity

Term Bond Due 4/1/2026:
04/01/2012 1,600,000.00 1.900% 100.000 1,600,000.00 1,600,000.00
04/01/2013 1,670,000.00 1.900% 100.000 1,670,000.00 1,670,000.00
04/01/2014 920,000.00 1.900% 100.000 920,000.00 920,000.00
04/01/2015 840,000.00 1.900% 100.000 840,000.00 840,000.00
04/01/2016 770,000.00 1.900% 100.000 770,000.00 770,000.00
04/01/2017 700,000.00 1.900% 100.000 700,000.00 700,000.00
04/01/2018 630,000.00 1.900% 100.000 630,000.00 630,000.00
04/01/2019 565,000.00 1.900% 100.000 565,000.00 565,000.00
04/01/2020 495,000.00 1.900% 100.000 495,000.00 495,000.00
04/01/2021 435,000.00 1.900% 100.000 435,000.00 435,000.00
04/01/2022 365,000.00 1.900% 100.000 365,000.00 365,000.00
04/01/2023 300,000.00 1.900% 100.000 300,000.00 300,000.00
04/01/2024 275,000.00 1.900% 100.000 275,000.00 275,000.00
04/01/2025 180,000.00 1.900% 100.000 180,000.00 180,000.00
04/01/2026 1,665,000.00 1.900% 100.000 1,665,000.00 1,665,000.00

11,410,000.00 11,410,000.00 11,410,000.00

Stated Weighted
Maturity Interest Issue Redemption Average

Date Rate Price at Maturity Maturity Yield

Final Maturity 04/01/2026 1.900% 1,665,000.00 1,665,000.00
Entire Issue 11,410,000.00 11,410,000.00 5.8002 1.9002%

Proceeds used for accrued interest 0.00
Proceeds used for bond issuance costs (including underwriters' discount) 114,345.00
Proceeds used for credit enhancement 0.00
Proceeds allocated to reasonably required reserve or replacement fund 0.00



Jan 17, 2012  11:38 am  Prepared by Citi    Page 7

PROOF OF ARBITRAGE YIELD

Cherokee County (GA)
General Obligation Park and Green Space Bonds, Series 2012

Final Numbers

Present Value
to 01/26/2012

Date Debt Service @  1.9001958%

04/01/2012 1,639,142.64 1,633,554.98
10/01/2012 93,195.00 92,003.19
04/01/2013 1,763,195.00 1,724,264.42
10/01/2013 77,330.00 74,910.86
04/01/2014 997,330.00 957,037.41
10/01/2014 68,590.00 65,199.47
04/01/2015 908,590.00 855,548.23
10/01/2015 60,610.00 56,534.57
04/01/2016 830,610.00 767,467.88
10/01/2016 53,295.00 48,780.11
04/01/2017 753,295.00 682,990.48
10/01/2017 46,645.00 41,893.62
04/01/2018 676,645.00 602,000.64
10/01/2018 40,660.00 35,834.12
04/01/2019 605,660.00 528,751.34
10/01/2019 35,292.50 30,520.97
04/01/2020 530,292.50 454,281.01
10/01/2020 30,590.00 25,958.63
04/01/2021 465,590.00 391,380.56
10/01/2021 26,457.50 22,031.18
04/01/2022 391,457.50 322,899.03
10/01/2022 22,990.00 18,785.14
04/01/2023 322,990.00 261,431.37
10/01/2023 20,140.00 16,148.10
04/01/2024 295,140.00 234,413.82
10/01/2024 17,527.50 13,790.13
04/01/2025 197,527.50 153,946.29
10/01/2025 15,817.50 12,211.61
04/01/2026 1,680,817.50 1,285,430.87

12,667,422.64 11,410,000.00

Proceeds Summary

Delivery date 01/26/2012
Par Value 11,410,000.00

Target for yield calculation 11,410,000.00
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COST OF ISSUANCE

Cherokee County (GA)
General Obligation Park and Green Space Bonds, Series 2012

Final Numbers

Cost of Issuance $/1000 Amount

Placement Agent Fee 4.50000 51,345.00
Bond/County Counsel 4.82033 55,000.00
Bank Legal Fees 0.61350 7,000.00
Misc. 0.08764 1,000.00

10.02147 114,345.00









































































































1 

STATE OF GEORGIA  
COUNTY OF CHEROKEE 

RESOLUTION NO. 2012 – R -  001  
 

WHEREAS, the Board of Elections and Registration of Cherokee County has requested 
that the Cherokee County Board of Commissioners set qualifying fees for various County 
offices within Cherokee County for the 2012 General Election pursuant to O.C.G.A. § 21-2-
131(a); and 
 

WHEREAS, the Board of Commissioners desires to comply with said request from the 
Board of Elections and Registration. 
 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Cherokee County Board of 
Commissioners and it is hereby enacted pursuant to the authority of the same that the 
following qualifying fees for the General Election to be held on Tuesday, November 6, 2012 
are hereby set, and shall be published prior to February 1, 2012 as required by law, as 
follows: 

 
1.  Board of Commissioners Member Post 2  $900.00 

 
2.  Board of Commissioners Member Post 3  $900.00 
 
3.  School Board Members     $216.00 
 
4.  Clerk of the Superior Court    $2,533.76 
 
5.  Judge of the Probate Court     $2,533.76 
 
6.  Cherokee County Sheriff     $2,597.16 
 
7.  Cherokee County Tax Commissioner   $2,533.76 
 
8.  Judge of the State Court     $3,921.81 
 
9.  Chief Judge of the Magistrate Court   $2,533.76 

  
10.   Chief Judge of the State Court    $3,921.81 
 
11.   Cherokee County Coroner     $35.00 
 
12.   Cherokee County Surveyor    $35.00 

  

ADOPTED this 17th day of January, 2012. 

              
L.B. Ahrens, Chairman 
Cherokee County Board of Commissioners 

Attest: 
      
Christy Black, County Clerk 
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